LIMPOPO

PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT
REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA

e S L e
DEPARTMENT OF

SPORT, ARTS AND CULTURE

Enqg : Modiba M.V / Mabasa L
Tel :015 284 4108/015 284 4093
Date : 31/01/2025

N OF IVED BID

BID DESCRIPTION: - SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LAPTOPS AND ALL IN ONE PC'S TO LIMPOPO
DEPARTMENT OF SPORT,ARTS AND CULTURE

Bid Number: DSAC 2024/25 — B9

Closing Date ; 28 January 2025

NO NAMEOF EIBDER TOTAL BID PRICE ON
SBD1
1 | RENDTICT (PTY)LTD R3 851 365.00
2 | NAMBITI TECHNOLOGIES R3 842 858.09
3 REVIVAL TECHNOLOGIES AND ACADEMY (PTY)LTD R4 198 504.01
4 | NAMASATHI GROUP R4 448 637.00
5 | THABO ROSSETE MANAMELA R1917 500.00
6 | SIRMARCO R4 550 000.00
7| LEOMASH 696 PROJECTS PTY LTD R3 814 645.00
8 CHM VUWANI COMPUTER AND SOLUTIONS (PTY)LTD | R3079 579.25
9 | INTRINSYC DZUMBA GROUP (PTY)LTD R3 489 732.50
10 | INTELLECTUAL OFFICE SUPPLY R4 620 700.00
11 | DIVHAMBELE TECHNOLOGIES R3 469 550.00
12 | ABI-CHAB CONTRACTORS CC R3 584 472.95
13 | PHAKIMALEBO TRADING R3 359 113.77
| 14 | BATSHA IT SOLUTIONS R3 053 077.50
15 | JRITRADING AND BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE ON SBD 1
16 | AUNT FUNIES TRADING COMPANY NOBIDPRICEONSBD1 |




17 | PHELCOM PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R4 143 435.50
18 | LESEDI LA DITSHABA TRADING ENTERPRISE R3 079 980.60
19 | |suv TECH SOLUTION R5 900 000.00
20| OLIVMO INVESTMENTS (PTY)LTD R3 348 495.25
21 | MURANGAPHANDA PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R5 550 000.00
22 | MATIMANA TRADING AND PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R4 263 625.00
23 | REG CORP PTYLTD R4 275 000.00
24 | XILUKS PROJECTS AND SERVICES (PTY)LTD R5 058 921.50
25 | MOKATUMELO TECHNOLOGIES (PTY)LTD R3 298 672.65
26 | TDS CONSULTING AND PROJECTS CC R3 077 500.00
27 NO BID PRICE ON SBD 1

MOSIMA IT SOLUTIONS (LPT006/2024)
28 | KNM AFRICA GROUP NO BID PRICE ON SBD 1
29 | NYIKO WA NHLAMU (PTY)LTD R4 401 367.98
30 | EZEVEE COMPUTER SOLUTIONS R3 595 762.50
31 | NHLAVE TRADING ENTERPRISE R3 462 390.00
32 | EMALANGENI TECHNOLOGIES (PTY)LTD R3 084 156.25
33 | AGNES MOYAHABO TRADING 1905 (PTY)LTD R3 989 975.00
34 | MPUMALANGA STAY(PTY)LTD R4 577 422.50
35 | VISION SPACE JV LEHLABILE DIGITAL HUB R2 144 265.15
36 | ESIZWE GROUP R4 622 265.15
37 | OPEN HOUSE CONSULTING R4 225 313.67
38 | DASH HOST (PTY)LTD R4 646 000.00
39 | MOSHABI TECHNOLOGIES (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE ON SBD 1
40 | MATLACAM PROJECT AND IT (PTY)LTD R3 582 000.00
41 | MUKONI SOFTWARE R4 519 500.00
42 | JNES GROUP (PTY)LTD R2 433 450.00
43 | ZORTEC TRADING (PTY)LTD R4 789 931.00
44 | NONIA FIELDS (PTY)LTD R3 573 200.00
45 | GINA SOLUTIONS (PTY)LTD R3 498 261.00
46 | AGEKEY CONNECTIONS (PTY)LTD R3 706 415.50
47 | CKM DEVELOPERS (PTY)LTD R3 392 500.00
48 | LENOZA GROUP R4 092 395.00
49 | CHARITOO ENTERPRISE CC R4 337 151.00
S0 | GOBEDI TRADING AND PROJECTS(PTY)LTD R2 844 809.50
51 | INNOVATE 24/7 (PTY)LTD R3 661 599.43
52 | SKYTOUCH THREE SUPPLIER TRADING R3 700 000.00
53 | MOAGI TECHNOLOGIES CC R4 194 758.40
54 | MONENE ICT SOLUTIONS AND PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R3 088 188.00
55 | MUSANDIWA SOLUTIONS (PTY)LTD R2 846 285.00
56 | NWETI WA TILO TRADING R5 761 213.00
57 | KWENABEL TRADING CC

R3 344 950.00




58

VHAKELA TRADING

R& 562 550.00

59 | MIANO SUPPLIER (PTY)LTD R3 235 237.50
60 | EMBELISHA (PTY)LTD R3 769 000.00
61 | EKAYA GROUP (PTY)LTD R3 870 660.00
62 | MABAPA TRADING CC T/A MAB TECHNOLOGIES R5 102 775.98
63 | MOKGADI TRADING AND SUPPLIES (PTY)LTD R2 330 000.00
64 | swizzTAcC (PTY)LTD R4 001 244.01
65 | TZAFRIKA R2 325 000.00
66 | KOPANO MOHULA TRADING ENTERPRISE R3 856 562.50
67 | FOURSIGHT IT BUSINESS SOLUTIONS R3 371 340.00
68 | WISE ONLINE RESEARCH AND MARKETING R6 644 576.95
89 | HUPIC COMMUNICATIONS R4 162 195.00
70 | MOKHALE CLEANING SERVICES R3 426 100.00
71 | MAWIKA TRADING AND PROJECTS 18 R5 554 385.00
72 | PELEBRA CONSTRUCTION AND SUPPLIES R4 556 127.50
73 | TIKIT SERVICES AND PROJECTS R2 889 429.63
74 | DIGITALCS (PTY)LTD R3 657 000.00
75 | CHAWINA TRADING ENTERPRISE CC R3 012 500.00
78 | AKB TECHNOLOGY R3 834 021.81
77 | ENABLING ICT SOLUTIONS R3 667 807.50
78 | MALOANE INFORMATION TECHNOLOGIES CC R3 025 200.00
79 | LVR PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R4 664 152.93
80 | NYELETIMTILENI R1982 500.00
81 | SANDILE STATIONERS R2 905 201.30
82 | KWADIKWADI TRADING ENTERPRISE R2 590 310.50
83 | CATRIDGE HUB SA R2 959 755.00
84 | MACKMALUCKS IT SOLUTIONS (PTY)LTD R3 408 830.00
85 | MADIBANA IT SOLUTIONS AND CABLING (PTY)LTD R4 404 040.00
86 | MKHARI TRADING R3 392 500.00
87 _| BAALPERAZIM SPARES AND SUPPLIERS R3 682 709.50
88 | TSHITAVHA TRADING (PTY)LTD R3 507 097.50
89 | FLOMOB TRADING AND SUPPLIES R2 650 000.00
90 | PEO INFORMATION TECHNOLOGIES R4 252 355.00
91 | MADIBA VISIONARIES (PTY)LTD R2 380 500.00
92 | SWIFTCONVERSIONS )PTY)LTD R1 875 000.00
93 | EASTGATE GLOBAL TECHNOLOGY (PTY)LTD R5 900 000.00
94 | EVIXM GENTRADE (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE ON SBD 1
95 | DELAVISTA HOLDINGS (PTY)LTD R3 624 985.00
96 | TUSHIA CONSULTING AGENCY R2 845 111.50
97 _| VUXENI INFORMATION TECHNOLOGIES RS 387 890.88
98

NEW LEAF OF LIFE FOR MOV MO (PTY)LTD

R3 097 775.00




99

THUSEGO INVESTMENTS (PTY)LTD

R2 999 000.00

100

RINMOSH INVESTMENT (PTY)LTD

R4 584 877.5

101

MOGADIME HOLDINGS

R3 082 500.00

102

FRATINITY TRADING ENTERPRISE

R3 558 600.00

103

MALTECHNOLOBYTES (PTY)LTD

R6 014 883.22

104

LISAMA BUSINESS ENTERPRISE

R3 051 800.00

105

PLKIT SOLUTIONS

R3 769 381.00

106

MACHAKA TRADING AND TECHNOLOGY

R3 065 210.00
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Mashele X.D
Acting Director: SCM




