LIMPOPO

REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA

PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT

DEPARTMENT OF
SPORT, ARTS AND CULTURE

PUBLICATION OF RECEIVED BIDS

Bid
Number

Bid

Description

DSAC2024/2025-B4

Rendering of 24 hours Physical Security Services to Limpopo Department of Sport,

Arts and Culture or a period of three years (36 Months )

Closing Date : 11 October 2024
Number of Bids received : 265

TOTAL BID PRICE ON

NUMBER NAME OF BIDDER SBD1
1 | SEBOKO SOLUTIONS CC R154 604 734.03
2 | MORVIC SECURITY GUARD (PTY)LTD R14 432 040.00
3 | XILOTA PROJECTS T/A XILOTA SECURITY SERVICES R184 576 332.12
4 | MOKHALABONE SECURITY (PTY)LTD R211 603 769.16
5 | LELOBA BRIGHT TRADING R150 199 907.00
6 | BACKLINE SECURITY AND CLEANING SERVICES R100 003 895.31
7 | GIJASECURITY & PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R251 929 599.06
8 | GAYISA SECURITY & ENTERPRISE NO BID PRICE
MAPOLOLO PROPERTIES T/A TSHAKA GUARDING
9 | SERVICES R65 395 313.18
10 | LANDELA SECURITY SERVICES R177 866 729.72
11 | NDIVHUWO SECURITY TRAINING NO BID PRICE
12 | TAKANA LIMPOPO (PTY)LTD R244 147 513.63
13 | DITIRO TSAKA SECURITY SERVICES R210 328 691.18
14 | NATIONAL PRIVATE SECURITY R93 581 057.61
15 | NTABASI BUSINESS TRADING R1939892 117.27
16 | KANANA TRADING ENTERPRISE R29 839 733.88
17 | DOUBLE OPTION TRADING 120 (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE
18 | MAXI SECURITY (PTY)LTD R188 323 873.38
19 | OMPWA TRADING ENTERPRISE R255 775 848.69
20 | THE ATEAM TASK FORCE (PTY)LTD R255 477 365.23
21 | SELECT SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R180 634 460.50
22 | MALOPE A PHAHLA TRADING AND PROJECTS R168 977 204.82
23 | SABELA NGAMANDLA SECURITY CONSULTANTS NO BID PRICE
24 | GWALA SECURITY (PTY)LTD R201 016 577.18
25 | FHATU AND SON SECURITY R65 017 579.00
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26 | MOLAPO-MOTLE ENTERPRISES AND CONSTRUCTION R149 320 067.34
27 | ANKHESIWE PTY LTD T/A THE BRAVE SECURITY R53 318 685.96
28 | MAFOKO SECURITY PATROLS R216 179 067.01
29 | MARUMO FASE SECURITY (PTY)LTD R255 776 167.28
30 | LIFE AT ITS BEST ENTERPRISE (PTY)LTD R262 207 463.39
31 | CHARLEY-TITE SECURITY R176 198 400.00
32 | KRA SECURITY AND PROJECTS R255 784 470.20
33 | ZAMANI SECURITY (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE
34 | MUFHATUTSHEDZWA PROTECTION SERVICES R226 654 228.30
35 | NKHENSI CAROL SECURITY SERVICE R242 984 742.00
36 | MIA TRADING ENTERPRISE SECURITY R166 329 460.00
37 | PHIKO LE SIZWE SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R150 184 439.84
38 | MMUSHO SECURITY AND PROJECTS R255 775 795.60
39 | RAMS HOLDINGS (PTY)LTD R255 775 588.20
40 | NYATSHILONGO SECURITY TRADING ENTERPRISE R182 628 088.00
41 | SIHLOMILE SECURITY SERVICES R185 578 660.24
42 | HWIBIDU GROUP T/A HWIBIDU PROTECTION SERVICES | R225 408 756.04
43 | MOLEBOGENG SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R200 838 646.14
44 | 3 DAUGHTERS SECURITY SERVICES R189 000 000.00
45 | THE LADY BOSS SECURITY SERVICES R126 575 828.42

46

NEPCARE SECURITY & PROJECTS (PTY)LTD

R21 422 982.00

MOHLALERWA PROTECTION CLEANING & PRIVATE

47 | INVESTIGATOR NO BID PRICE
48 | NMT TACTICAL (PTY)LTD R94 427 129.46
49 | MATHABANG TRADING & PROJECTS R201 691 921.49
50 | DMD SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R128 762 273.26
51 | MULMAK SECURITY & PROJECTS R175 382 557.20
52 | MAMAYILA TRADING ENTERPRISE R108 195 151.02
53 | WHITE LEOPARD SECURITY R8 397 595.00
54 | MJAYELI SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R90 116 882.57
55 | HLOGOTLOU PROJECTS MANAGEMENT NO BID PRICE
56 | ROKOMA SECURITY R62 687 637.26
57 | CLYROTRIX R339 172 192.52
58 | UNA SECURITY NO BID PRICE
59 | WANGIS SECURITY SERVICES R52 111 753.32
60 | MUTHU MONI CONSTRUCTION AND PROJETCS R109 130 458.32
61 | TSHAKHWILO TRADING ENTERPRISE R255 099 703.00
62 | BOLEDI CONSTRUCTION R607 987 042.18
63 | LETABA SECURITY R51 847 206.24
64 | BANA BA MOSEBJADI SECURITY FORCE R112 228 306.41
65 | NOBES SECURITY R176 324 131.00
66 | DISTINCTIVE PROTECTION AND CLEANING (PTY)LTD R248 047 893.20
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67 | LITHENGAZWI SECURITY SERVICES R47 043 647.40
68 | GS SECURITY FORCE CC R261 828 442 84
69 | MABOTWANE SECURITY SERVICES CC R37 657 176.65
70 | COMBAT SECURITY GUARDING (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE
71 | SEBATA KGOMO SECURITY CC R812 094 475.05
72 | ZIWAPHI CRIME PREVENTION R191 533 438.36
73 | MCC SECURITY & PROJECTS CC R245573901.92
74 | KOMASE CONSTRUCTION & PROJECTS R224 537 991.12
75 | RED ANT SECURITY RELOCATION & EVICTION SERVICES R232 001 003.22
76 | OB SECURITY AND PROJECTS R170 310 872.88

LUANAME TRADING ENTERPRISE T/A MTE SECURIYT

77 | SOLUTIONS R73061996.1
78 | MATSODI TRADING ENTERPRISE R255 855 029.64
79 | ZINJIVHA BUILDING CONSTRUCTION AND SECURITY R81 410 944.80
80 | FNM SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE

ISOLUTIONS INNOVATION GROUP T/A NIGHT WOLF

81 | SECURITY R151903 742.04
82 | BOLLE TECHNOLOGIES R78 267 968.71
83 | MOLOMO AND SONS SECURITY R136 104 009.45
84 | DUMIRO SECURITY SERVICES R334 265 913.48
85 | SILVER SOLUTIONS 1522 R218 575 555.60
86 | IMVULA QUALITY PROTECTION(AFRICA) NO BID PRICE
87 | ITSHALA SECURITY AND ARMED REACTION R178 252 070.92
88 | ELPHASH TRADING ENTERPRISE R72 756 745.68
89 | DIKGAETSEDI TRADING AND PROJECTS R197 312 820.36
90 | STAN-COW SECURITY SERVICES AND PROJECTS R14 425 830.00
91 | MAPHETO BUSINESS SERVICES R255 767 457.48
92 | MUKOMATI MINING SERVICES R179 091 180.00
93 | MMAMPHENG CONSTRUCTION AND SECURITY SERVICES | R235 749 016.44
94 | MAKJUS HOLDINGS NO BID PRICE
95 | SIYEJABULA SECURITY SOLUTIONS R174 547 207.74
96 | LINDA INTERGRATED SECURITY (PTY)LTD R61 045 082.90
97 | MORITI TRANSPORT AND SECURITY SERVICES R168 832 169.28
98 | 4B PROTECTION SERVICES (PTY)LTD R254 108 093.48
99 | TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES LIMPOPO PROVINCE R97 693 865.82
100 | INTERWORK JV VIMBA R173 500 265.84
101 | GEMINI ELEMENTS (A & B) R207 233 849.22
102 | MASTER IN FORCE SECURITY SERVICES R174 394 329.36
103 | EULITSAKI CONSTRUCTION AND CLEANING ENTERPRISE | R260 083 967.50
104 | CHAIRMAN SECURITY SERVICES R79 429 796.00
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DINOKO MONYELA GENERAL PROJECTS AND SECURITY

105 | SERVICES R167 580 000.00
106 | ROKONA SECURITY NO BID PRICE
107 | PAPAMIKE PROTECTION SERVICES (PTY)LTD R199 139 771.42
108 | VIMTSIRE PROTECTION SERVICES R106 313 126.00
109 | KGOSI MONENE GENERAL SERVICES(A&B) NO BID PRICE
110 | RIGAYISI DEVELOPMENT SERVICES R630 103 891.79
111 | LESHAGA PROTECTION SERVICES R41 073 226.36
112 | R5 SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R247 210 417.14
113 | SHINNING STAR SECURITY AND PROJECT (PTY)LTD R70 439 468.04
114 | JONAH ZWIYO PROJECTS R67 326 750.59
115 | PHAWENI SECURITY R170 303 555.36
116 | LION KING SECURITY SERVICES R219 176 446.71
117 | SWINAYENA DEVELOPMENT R193 495 758.1
118 | BATHLOKOMEDI MANAGEMENT SERVICES R116 719 804.89
119 | TRUST ONE GUARD SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
120 | MOTANE INVESTMENT CC R51 058 081.92
121 | MARSHAL NIGHTS SECURITY SERVICES R125 023 271.00
122 | NKFC SECURITY AND PROJECTS CC R192 119 573.60
123 | THOBJA M SECURITY R112 925 441.00
124 | MONIKA SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R238 221 798.40
125 | MAGORO SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
126 | MAZIBUKU SECURITY AND PROJECTS R200 966 716.92
127 | TSHIMOLLO SECURITY SERVICES R205 712 302.69
128 | AKANI CORPORATE SOLUTIONS(A&B) R192 120 589.30
129 | TJ PROTECTION SERVCIES R255 776 562.96
PUT TOGETHER TRADING T/A UMVIKELI SECURITY
130 | SERVICES CC NO BID PRICE
131 | SWA MISWAZI BUSINESS ENTERPRISE R226 654 228.30
132 | LEBELANG MAHLATSE TRADINGS(PTY)LTD R207 573 826.65
133 | KATEKANI SECURITY SERVICES R240 525 121.69
134 | IZINGWENYA 210 INVESTMENTS R25 774 427.88
135 | VOLCANIA PROJECTS AND SECURITY SERVICES R257 079 509.16
136 | DOUBLE BARREL SECURITY SERVICES R257 079 509.16
137 | MATHARA INVESTMENTS R273017 128.83
138 | SEDIMA SECURITY AND CLEANING SERVICES R178 244 196.7
139 | HOSHANI SECURITY SERVICES R36 961 800.00
140 | TUBATSE SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
STARWAYS PROTECTION SERVICES JV PHILLIP M

141 | TRADING R53 641 498.60
142 | KAMPONGA SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R47 310 637.14
143 | GANN TRADING NO BID PRICE
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144 | BIRIKIYA SECURITY SERVICES(A&B) NO BID PRICE
145 | MANJA GENERAL TRADING R47522 871.77
146 | TOUNG SECURITY SERVICES R223 859 946.98
147 | AFRICANISM SECURITY SERVICES (PTY)LTD R196 456 643.14
148 | NTSIBISHENG SECURITY SERVICES R55 983 293.00
149 | MAREBOLE SECURITY SOLUTIONS (PTY)LTD R254 401 670.30
150 | VB AND SONS SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
151 | MFANA ENTERPRISE (A&B) R25 464 295.80
152 | INTRALOGIC SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
153 | JUDE PROTECTION SERVICES R190 899 710.40
154 | TLOU NOKO SECURITY SERVICES R238 804 910.00
155 | NKN SECURITY SERVICES JV R45 597 142.06
156 | LADY-T PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
157 | MODISE PROTECTION SERVICES (A&B) R88 994 143.14
158 | MAEMO SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
159 | DROSS SECURITY (PTY)LTD R240 525 121.69
160 | PHETMOG SECURITY (PTY)LTD R222 881 253.21
161 | THABO YA LETSATSI TRADING AND PROJECTS 145 R176 369 050.00
162 | METRO 50 SECURITY SERVICES R196 607 996.28
163 | LYNX SECURITY SOLUTIONS ANVANT 24 JV R129 622 248.00
164 | LINSPIYE 134 CC R144 379 603.29
165 | XIHLOVO SECURITY TRAINING R206 357 951.60
166 | COG SECURITY & PROJECTS R62 158 182.20
167 | MOGOLA SECURITY & CLEANING NO BID PRICE
168 | DIYATA DITSHABA (PTY)LTD R178 782 472.89
169 | LETIQA TWINS TRADING T/A LETIQA SECURITY SERVICES | R204 392 762.86
170 | ECL PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
171 | MOSHABI SECURITY NO BID PRICE
REPEAT TRADING ENTERPRISE JV MAAKE NGHALA
172 | SECURITY R524 968 173.76
173 | MPHAGANE TRADING ENTERPRISE R131 718 838.30
174 | CALVIN & FAMILY SECURITY SERVICES - FTM/20/24/25 R32 281 313.65
175 | MAHLAKOMONI SECURITY SERVICES R191 726 088.62
176 | MAKONDELELO PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
177 | ODIEILE MOLELO TRADING 822 R117 149 151.72
178 | EX-CO SECURITY (PTY)LTD R189 707 026.39
WANGANAE TRADING ENTERPRISE T/A ORIAN SECURITY

179 | SOLUTIONS NO BID PRICE
180 | MOKATO SECURITY SERVICES AND PROJECTS R147 616 435.56
181 | KAMBOBO SECURITY NO BID PRICE
182 | KHENSANI SECURITY SERVICES & TRADING R259 266 029.15
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183 | PHEPHA MV SECURITY SERVICES R119 404 890.49
184 | MAKHABA SECURITY SERVICES R196 784 795.88
BORNFREE VIP BODYGUARDING AND SECURITY

185 | SERVICES NO BID PRICE
186 | LETONA 6 SECURITY R103 329 939.00
187 | MSENGE PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
188 | MC TEE HOLDINGS R219 137 784.00
189 | ELITE CLOSE PROTECTION AND SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
190 | NOBANTU GUARDING R139 440 693.72
191 | ANNIE SECURITY AND TRADING R321 680 036.00
192 | PTWOODS-MOTHOLU SECURITY R109 193 664.00
193 | RIAKONA TRADING ENTERPRISE SECURITY R183 435 865.00
194 | LIVHU NA MASHUDU SECURITY AND TRADING R187 389 275.16
195 | NOKO M D SECURITY AND TRADING R202 276 232.00
196 | EMMAQUELATE SECURITY R200 933 550.07
197 | WENZILE PHAPHAMA SECURITY SERVICES R232 001 822.00
198 | UNITRADE 1047 T/A ISIDINGO SECURITY SERVICES R95 160 320.56
199 | DIAMOND JAM INVESTMENTS R102701712.90
200 | MSM PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
201 | SASELAMANI SECURITY NO BID PRICE
202 | PRISTO RESPONSE TRADING NO BID PRICE
203 | TSHIRAKA SECURITY SERVICES R87 602 337.06
204 | NYARHIPROTECTION UNIT R67 763 354.64
205 | ALEGRO PROTECTION SERVICES R256 929 710.52
206 | SECURELIFE SECURITY SERVICES R108 150 118.24
207 | KOPJANE SECURITY & CLEANING SERVICES NO BID PRICE
208 | NKARI SECURITY AND GENERAL PROJECTS R256 075 881.48
209 | KBMP PROTECTION SERVICES R212 830 890.72
210 | SINYUWANISECURITY SERVICES R239 757 426.38
211 | VAKHOMENI SECURITY NO BID PRICE
212 | MUPONI PROPERTY MANAGEMENT CC R184 150 205.62
213 | LEGIT SECURITY SOLUTIONS R186 302 341.53
214 | GEE-UNIT SECURITY &CRIMES PREVENTION UNIT R21 248 987.43
215 | MUXERO ARMED RESPONSE & SECURITY SERVICES R90641912.08
216 | IMMEDIATE FORCES SECURITY R243 093 657.00
217 | PAYLESS PROJECTS AND SECURITY R120 249 603.00
218 | MAZAXA CONSTRUCTION AND PROJECTS R224 353 224.04
219 | MMADIOLWANA BUSINESS ENTERPRISE R232770675.16
220 | BBT SECURITY SOLUTIONS(PTY)LTD R248 384 895.36
221 | DAN PROTECTION SERVICES (PTY)LTD R32217535.11
222 | VHUGI PROTECTION SERVICES R198 226 282.00
223 | NEW NYATHI TRADING ENTERPRISE R144 229 631.00
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225 | MPHEPHU SECURITY SERVICES R237 403 370.62
226 | ZACK-JACK SECURITY SERVICES CC NO BID PRICE
227 | MASHUSHE PROTECTION SERVICES R94 265 267.20
228 | KGABA LOGISTIC AND PROJECTS NO BID PRICE
229 | MR POPO PROTECTION SERVICES NO BID PRICE
230 | MALWANDLA SECURITY SERVICES R37 501 636.44
231 | TOP CLASS SECURITY & CLEANING SERVICES NO BID PRICE
232 | KAN SECURITY SOLUTIONS R199 250 451.51
TSHEPANG ENTERPRISE CONSTRUCTION,BOOKSHOP &

233 | SECURITY R144 929 666.65
234 | URCIA TRADING ENTERPRISE R61687 201.80
235 | BEST 4 ALL PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R203 854 912.26
236 | NERUPA HOLDINGS PROJECTS NO BID PRICE
237 | SNIPER SECURITY JV PISTOL 007 SECURITY (PTY)LTD R200 271 785.54
238 | KOLDEN ARROWS SECURITY SERVICES R29 808 993.24
239 | VISION TRADING (PTY)LTD NO BID PRICE
240 | RATITO HOLDINGS NO BID PRICE
241 | THEMARU (PTY)LTD R130 020 970.68
242 | MAKGOBATHE SECURITY SERVICES R205 660 529.87
243 | SIJR & BOKAMOSO SECURITY SERVICES JOINTVENTURE | R236 578 503.51
244 | RAKHUTSETSA SECURITY SERVICES R260 904 960.31
245 | KTS GENERAL TRADER NO BID PRICE
246 | PITS| YAMMA CONSTRUCTION & SECURITY (PTY)LTD R233909 712.12
247 | MARHUMBINI SECURITY GUARDS & PATROL R88 688 047.44
248 | THUMAMINA HYGIENE FOOD AND SECURITY SOLUTIONS | R219 107 265.80
249 | MUGHWENA TRADING PROJECTS R256 095 879.40
250 | ARCTIC FOX SECURITY (PTY)LTD R191 726 088.62
251 | JUDY AND NEWIE PROJECTS NO BID PRICE
252 | RED HAWKS ARMY PROTECTION PROJECTS (PTY)LTD R174 124 253.00
253 | RAY BEE TRADING ENTERPRISE NO BID PRICE
254 | CAVE SECURITY AND TRAINING R172 527 123.04
255 | KGOMAGANANG BUSINESS ENTERPRISE NO BID PRICE
256 | SKONYE TRADING ENTERPRISE (PTY)LTD R180 962 190.72
257 | BROWN DOGS SECURITY UNITY CC R121 450 120.00
258 | PETKAY TRADING ENTERPRISE R255 756 037.12
259 | MAMORAKA SECURITY SERVICES CC R212 668 527.15
260 | MUSHOMA SECURITY SERVICES & PROJECTS CC R254 108 103.48
261 | MAN ON THE MOVE BUSINESS ENTERPRISE CC R22 248 129.40
262 | FEPANG PROTECTION GROUP R191 544 000.02
263 | MPHOSHA SECURITY SERVICES R109 269 581.29
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264

GAP MANAGEMENT (PTY)LTD

R144 718 668.62

265

OMOLEMO SECURITY SERVICES

R177 003 300.45
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